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SR NO. OVERVIEW OF ACTIVITIES KEY PUBLICATIONS 

1 Spokesperson Profiling:-   

● Jyoti Vaswani 

● Ruchira Bharadwaja 

● Munish Sharda 

● CNBC TV 18 

● Times Group (High Tea 

Live Chat 

● ET BFSI CXO Conclave 

2019 

2 Read the fine print on your insurance plan to 

avoid setbacks 

● Nirmal Gujarat 

● Gujarat Pranam 

● Standard Herald 

● Vyapar 

● Daily News 

● Rajasthan Patrika 

● Free Press Gujarat 

● Western Times 

● Samachar Jagat 

● Rajasthan Khoj Khabar 

● Khabaro ki Duniya 



 

3 Better Customer Service in Future Generali 

India Life Insurance adopted "Digital First" 

● Sukhabar 

● Vyapar 

● Prabhurashtra 

● Sambad Prabha 

● Arthik Lipi 

● Dainik Jagran 

● Dainik Statesman 

● Navgujarat Samay 

● Jai Hind 

● Arthik Dhara 

● Samagya 

● DNA 

● The Statesman 

● The Echo of India 

● Navgujarat Samay 

● Standard Herald 

● Free Press Gujarat 

● Western Times 

● Dainik Navjyoti 

● Rajasthan Patrika 

● Khabaro ki Duniya 

● Rajasthan khoj Khabar 

● Samachar Jagat 

● Daily News 

4 Miscellaneous ● The Hindu Business Line 

● DNA 

● Business Standard 

● Money Control 

● Stock Market 

● Bull Fax 

 
 
 
 

 



 

SR 

NO 

Publication Headline Date Coverage 

appeared 

National Press Release 

1 
CNBC TV18 

Jyoti Vaswani is live on CNBC 
TV18  

08​th​May 
2019 

TV 

2 The Hindu 
Business Line 

Premium Tracker 
27​th​May 

2019 
Print 

3 
DNA Expert View 

26​th​May 
2019 

Print 

4 
Business Standard 

Check veracity before signing 
policy form 

23​rd​May 
2019 

Print 

5 
Nirmal Gujarat 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

22​nd​May 
2019 

Print 

6 
Gujarat Pranam 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

22​nd​May 
2019 

Print 

7 

Sukhabar 

Better Customer Service in 
Future Generali India Life 

Insurance  adopted "Digital 
First" 

21​st​May 2019 

Print 

8 The Hindu 
Business Line 

Premium Tracker 
20​th​May 

2019 
Print 

9 
Standard Herald 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

20​th​May 
2019 

Print 

10 
Vyapar 

FGILI adopts "Digital First" 
strategy 

18​th​May 
2019 

Print 

11 

Vyapar 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks says Future Generali 
India Life Insurance Company 

Limited 

18​th​May 
2019 

Print 

12 
Prabhurashtra 

Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing the 

customer experience 

18​th​May 
2019 

Print 



 

13 
Sambad Prabha 

Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing the 

customer experience 

18​th​May 
2019 

Print 

14 
Daily News 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

18​th​May 
2019 

Print 

15 
Rajasthan Patrika 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

18​th​May 
2019 

Print 

16 
Arthik Lipi 

The insurance companies 
need to focus on customers 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

17 
Dainik Jagran 

The insurance companies 
need to focus on customers 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

18 
Dainik Statesman 

The insurance companies 
need to focus on customers 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

19 
Navgujarat Samay 

Future Generali creates 
awareness about policies 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

20 
Free Press Gujarat 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

21 
Western Times 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

22 

Samachar Jagat 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks says Future Generali 
India Life Insurance Company 

Limited 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

23 

Rajasthan Khoj 
Khabar 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks says Future Generali 
India Life Insurance Company 

Limited 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 

24 

Khabaro ki Duniya 

Read the fine print on your 
insurance plan to avoid 

setbacks says Future Generali 
India Life Insurance Company 

Limited 

17​th​May 
2019 

Print 



 

25 
Jai Hind 

The digital arm of FGILI is 
witnessing a change 

16​th​May 
2019 

Print 

26 
Arthik Dhara 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing the 

customer experience 

16​th​May 
2019 

Print 

27 
Samagya 

Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing the 

customer experience 

16​th​May 
2019 

Print 

28 
DNA FGILI focuses on digitization 

15​th​May 
2019 

Print 

29 
The Statesman 

FGILI adopts "Digital First" 
strategy 

15​th​May 
2019 

Print 

30 
The Echo of India 

FGILI adopts "Digital First" 
strategy 

15​th​May 
2019 

Print 

31 
Navgujarat Samay FGILI focuses on digitization 

15​th​May 
2019 

Print 

32 
Standard Herald 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing the 

customer experience 

15​th​May 
2019 

Print 

33 
Free Press Gujarat 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing 
customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

34 
Western Times 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing 
customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

35 
Dainik Navjyoti 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing 
customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

36 
Rajasthan Patrika 

FGILI is going through a 
change in the digital landscape 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

37 
Khabaro ki Duniya 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing 
customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

38 
Rajasthan khoj 

Khabar 

Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing the 

customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 



 

39 
Samachar Jagat 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing 
customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

40 
Daily News 

How Future Generali India Life 
Insurance is changing 
customer experience 

14​th​May 
2019 

Print 

41 The Hindu 
Business Line 

Premium Tracker 
13​th​May 

2019 
Print 

42 The Hindu 
Business Line 

Premium Tracker 
06​th​May 

2019 
Print 

43 
Money Control 

Why technology is a strategic 
priority for insurance 

companies today 

23​rd​May 
2019 

Online 

44 
Stock Market 

Why technology is a strategic 
priority for insurance 

companies today 

23​rd​May 
2019 

Online 

45 
Money Control 

Digital transformation for 
Customer Connect 

08​th​May 
2019 

Online 

46 
Bull Fax 

Am i doing enough for my 
financial future? 

05​th​May 
2019 

Online 

47 
Money Control 

In today’s digital era, 
leveraging data is key for 

marketers: Rakesh Wadhwa 

03​rd​May 
2019 

Online 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/why-technology-is-a-strategic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today-4012191.html
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/why-technology-is-a-strategic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today-4012191.html
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/why-technology-is-a-strategic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today-4012191.html
https://stocksmarket.in/316503/2019/05/23/why-technology-is-a-strategic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today/
https://stocksmarket.in/316503/2019/05/23/why-technology-is-a-strategic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today/
https://stocksmarket.in/316503/2019/05/23/why-technology-is-a-strategic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today/
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/digital-transformation-for-customer-connect-3949291.html
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/digital-transformation-for-customer-connect-3949291.html
https://www.bullfax.com/?q=node-am-i-doing-enough-my-financial-future
https://www.bullfax.com/?q=node-am-i-doing-enough-my-financial-future
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/in-todays-digital-era-leveraging-data-is-key-for-marketers-rakesh-wadhwa-3924821.html
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/in-todays-digital-era-leveraging-data-is-key-for-marketers-rakesh-wadhwa-3924821.html
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/in-todays-digital-era-leveraging-data-is-key-for-marketers-rakesh-wadhwa-3924821.html


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ELECTRONIC COVERAGE 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 08​th​May 2019 

TV CNBC TV 18 

Headline Jyoti Vaswani is live on CNBC TV18 Show: Closing bell 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

PRINT COVERAGE 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 27​th​May 2019 

Publication The Hindu Business Line 

Headline Premium Tracker 

 

 

 

Date 26​th​May 2019 



 

Publication DNA 

Headline Expert View 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 23​rd​May 2019 

Publication Business Standard 

Headline Check veracity before signing policy form 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 22​nd​May 2019 

Publication Nirmal Gujarat 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 22​nd​May 2019 

Publication Gujarat Pranam 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 21​st​May 2019 

Publication Sukhabar 

Headline 
Better Customer Service in Future Generali India Life Insurance  adopted 

"Digital First" 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 20​th​May 2019 

Publication The Hindu Business Line 

Headline Premium Tracker 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 20​th​May 2019 

Publication Standard Herald 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 18​th​May 2019 

Publication Vyapar 

Headline FGILI adopts "Digital First" strategy 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 18​th​May 2019 

Publication Vyapar 

Headline 
Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks says Future 

Generali India Life Insurance Company Limited 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 18​th​May 2019 

Publication Prabhurashtra 

Headline Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing the customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 18​th​May 2019 

Publication Sambad Prabha 

Headline Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing the customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 18​th​May 2019 

Publication Daily News 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 18​th​May 2019 

Publication Rajasthan Patrika 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Arthik Lipi 

Headline The insurance companies need to focus on customers 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Dainik Jagran 

Headline The insurance companies need to focus on customers 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Dainik Statesman 

Headline The insurance companies need to focus on customers 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Navgujarat Samay 

Headline Future Generali creates awareness about policies 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Free Press Gujarat 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Western Times 

Headline Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Samachar Jagat 

Headline 
Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks says Future 

Generali India Life Insurance Company Limited 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Rajasthan Khoj Khabar 

Headline 
Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks says Future 

Generali India Life Insurance Company Limited 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 17​th​May 2019 

Publication Khabaro ki Duniya 

Headline 
Read the fine print on your insurance plan to avoid setbacks says Future 

Generali India Life Insurance Company Limited 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 16​th​May 2019 

Publication Jai Hind 

Headline The digital arm of FGILI is witnessing a change 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 16​th​May 2019 

Publication Arthik Dhara 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing the customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 16​th​May 2019 

Publication Samagya 

Headline Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing the customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 15​th​May 2019 

Publication DNA 

Headline FGLI focuses on digitization 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Date 15​th​May 2019 



 

Publication The Statesman 

Headline FGILI adopts "Digital First" strategy 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Date 15​th​May 2019 



 

Publication The Echo of India 

Headline FGILI adopts "Digital First" strategy 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 15​th​May 2019 

Publication Navgujarat Samay 

Headline FGLI focuses on digitization 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 15​th​May 2019 

Publication Standard Herald 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing the customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Free Press Gujarat 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Western Times 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Dainik Navjyoti 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Rajasthan Patrika 

Headline FGILI is going through a change in the digital landscape 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Khabaro ki Duniya 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Rajasthan khoj Khabar 

Headline Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing the customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 14​th​May 2019 

Publication Samachar Jagat 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 14thMay 2019 

Publication Daily News 

Headline How Future Generali India Life Insurance is changing customer experience 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 13​th​May 2019 

Publication The Hindu Business Line 

Headline Premium Tracker 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 06​th​May 2019 

Publication The Hindu Business Line 

Headline Premium Tracker 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ONLINE COVERAGE 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 23​rd​May 2019 

Publication Money Control 

Headline Why technology is a strategic priority for insurance companies today 

Link 
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/why-technology-is-a-strate

gic-priority-for-insurance-companies-today-4012191.html 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Date 23​rd​May 2019 

Publication Stock Market 

Headline Why technology is a strategic priority for insurance companies today 

Link 
https://stocksmarket.in/316503/2019/05/23/why-technology-is-a-strategic-pr

iority-for-insurance-companies-today/ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 08​th​May 2019 

Publication Money Control 

Headline Digital transformation for Customer Connect 

Link 
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/digital-transformation-for-

customer-connect-3949291.html 

 

 

 

 

 

https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/digital-transformation-for-customer-connect-3949291.html
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/digital-transformation-for-customer-connect-3949291.html


 

Date 05​th​May 2019 

Publication Bull Fax 

Headline Am I doing enough for my financial future? 

Link https://www.bullfax.com/?q=node-am-i-doing-enough-my-financial-future 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Date 03​rd​May 2019 

Publication Money Control 

Headline In today’s digital era, leveraging data is key for marketers: Rakesh Wadhwa 

Link 
https://www.moneycontrol.com/news/technology/in-todays-digital-era-lever

aging-data-is-key-for-marketers-rakesh-wadhwa-3924821.html 

 

 

 

 

 


